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Section 2 
 
I. Summary 
 

This Administrative Directive (ADM) provides information regarding a local district’s option to 
suspend the enforcement of utility repayment agreements, during the cold weather period, for 
households defaulting on an existing utility repayment agreement and applying for assistance 
with a current utility (natural gas and/or electricity) related emergency. For the purpose of this 
suspension only, the cold weather period is defined as November 1st of each year and ending 
April 15th of the following year. 
 
This ADM provides notice to all local districts that Chapter 318 of the Laws of 2009 amends 
Social Services Law § 131-s by requiring the term of any utility repayment agreement signed on 
or after August 11, 2009 be extended from 12 months to 24 months.  As a result, the Utility 
Arrears Repayment Agreement form (Attachment B) or any local equivalent should be modified 
to reflect the extension in that repayment term. This change is not a local district option. This 
change has no impact on the terms of the Shelter Arrears Repayment Agreement. 
 
 

II. Purpose 
 
The purpose of this ADM is to provide details to the local districts regarding recent changes to 
Temporary Assistance energy assistance related policy relating to the optional suspension of 
utility arrears repayment agreements during the period of cold weather as defined in regulation. 
Additionally, this release advises districts of a mandatory change in the terms of Utility Arrears 
Repayment Agreements entered into on or after August 11, 2009. 
 
 

III. Background 
 
In accordance with SSL §131-s(1) and 18 NYCRR § 352.5(e), certain households with a utility 
(electric or natural gas) emergency are required to sign a Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement 
as a condition of eligibility for an emergency Temporary Assistance (TA) utility arrears 
payment. A Non-Temporary Assistance (NTA) household must sign such a repayment 
agreement as a condition of receiving utility arrears assistance when the customer and tenant of 
record is not categorized as a TA or Supplemental Security Income (SSI) household at the time 
of request for emergency assistance. Additionally, the NTA household’s gross monthly income 
on the date of application must exceed the TA standard of need for that household size. The 
terms of the agreement require repayment within two years (one year prior to August 11, 2009) 
from the date of the payment. To receive subsequent utility arrears payments, the household must 
have repaid the previous repayment agreement or be current on the payment obligations of any 
prior utility arrears repayment agreement. 

 
An amendment to the regulation 18 NYCRR § 352(e) now provides districts with the option of 
suspending  the enforcement of previous and new repayment agreements during the cold weather 
period, as defined in regulation for individuals defaulting on an existing utility arrears repayment 
agreement but facing a new utility (natural gas and/or electricity only) emergency. Additionally, 
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beginning August 11, 2009, Chapter 318 of the Laws of 2009 now extends the term of the 
repayment agreement from one year (12-months) to two years (24-months). 
 
Note: Recipients of recurring TA or SSI are not required to sign a Utility Arrears 
Repayment Agreement for utility payment assistance. 
 

 
IV. Program Implications 

 
Definition of Terms Specific to Utility Arrears Repayment Agreements 

 
• Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement: This is an agreement that an NTA applicant and 

his/her spouse sign to repay the arrears assistance to the district within twenty-four months. 
 

• Household: A household includes all persons residing in the applicant’s dwelling unit, 
including related and unrelated persons, such as lodgers, roomers and borders, foster children 
and wards or employees who share the dwelling unit. 

 
• Gross Income: Gross income is all income (earned, unearned and in-kind) before any 

deductions are taken, including such income of all persons in the household definition. 
 

• Dwelling Unit: A dwelling is a house, apartment, trailer, duplex, room(s) or other living 
quarters used as a home by members of a household. 

 
• Cold Weather Period: (exclusively for the suspension of a Utility Repayment Agreement) 

is November 1st of each year and ending April 15th of the following year. 
 

Temporary Assistance Standard of Need 
 
 The Temporary Assistance Standard of Need is the sum of the following items for the same 

household size: 
 

• Basic allowance (Schedule SA-2a) 
 

• Home Energy allowance (HEA) (Schedule SA-2b) 
 

• Supplemental Home Energy Allowance (SHEA) (Schedule SA-2c) 
 

• Shelter allowance as paid not to exceed maximum amount in Department Regulations 18 
NYCRR § 352.3 

 
• Heating allowance if the applicant is the tenant of record and customer of record for the 

residential heating bill (Schedules SA-6a, SA-6b or SA-5) 
 

Utility Arrears Repayment Agreements continue to use the standard of need in effect on the date 
of application for assistance. 
 
NTA Households include those households where, at the time of the request for emergency 
assistance, the customer of record is: 
 



OTDA 09-ADM-17 
(Rev. 10/2009) 4 

• not in active receipt of TA or SSI 
 
• a grantee in receipt of TA for dependent children and the grant is not budgeted with a heating 

allowance 
 
• under a TA sanction and the TA case is closed as a result of the sanction.  
 
NOTE: NTA households include applicants for recurring Temporary Assistance. 
 
The customer of record must also be the tenant of record (or spouse or surviving spouse) in all cases. 

 
The district choosing to suspend enforcement of the terms of utility arrears repayment 
agreements for a household facing a new utility emergency, and who is in default of existing 
Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement(s), must process the request for subsequent utility arrears 
payments without regard to the status of the repayment obligations of any previous Utility 
Arrears Repayment Agreement. This suspension does not uniformly suspend the repayment 
terms of all of a district’s utility arrears repayment agreements, but involves only those 
households with unmet repayment terms when the applicant applies for assistance to meet a 
subsequent utility emergency. The suspension option does not preclude the applicant’s eligibility 
requirement of signing a new Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement before the local district 
authorizes a TA payment to meet the utility emergency. The terms of a new Utility Arrears 
Repayment Agreement signed during the suspension period begin on April 16th with a two-year 
term, regardless of when the assistance was granted. For any previous utility arrears repayment 
agreements, the repayment terms will resume on April 16th, adjusted to compensate for the 
suspension period. This could result in some individuals having more than one repayment 
agreement in effect at the end of the suspension. Although a local district has decided to offer the 
suspension, recipients of the suspension may continue to make payments on utility arrears 
repayment agreements during this period. 
 
If a district chooses to suspend enforcement of utility arrears repayment agreements for an 
upcoming cold weather period, the district must apply the suspension criteria uniformly across 
all applications for TA emergency utility assistance. This policy does not affect a district’s 
ability to secure a lien for emergency energy assistance as granted under Family Assistance, 
Safety Net Assistance, Emergency Safety Net Assistance or Emergency Assistance to Families. 
 
If an applicant signs a Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement and then becomes eligible for TA 
or SSI, districts must suspend any unpaid balance on his/her arrears payment until such person is 
no longer receiving TA or SSI. Suspended utility arrears repayment agreements are not subject 
to recoupment. When the person no longer receives TA or SSI benefits, the unpaid balance will 
again become due to the district under the terms of the agreement. 
 
Applicants facing non-utility (other than electric or natural gas) heating emergencies are not 
required to sign repayment agreements. 
 
The terms for any new Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement signed on or after August 11, 2009 
increase from one-year (12-months) to two years (24-months) from the date of the assistance 
payment. 

 
These policy changes are not applicable to Emergency Safety Net Assistance repayment 
agreements for shelter arrears.  
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V. Required Action 
 

Local districts must determine whether they will choose the option to suspend the enforcement of 
Utility Arrears Repayment Agreements prior to November 1, 2009, and must maintain this 
option for the duration of the cold weather period, defined for this suspension as November 1st 
through April 15th. Local districts choosing this option, must apply the option district-wide when 
an NTA household makes a request for assistance with a utility emergency and has an 
outstanding agreement in default of the repayment terms of the original terms of the Utility 
Arrears Repayment Agreement. Districts are not required to notify OTDA of their decision to 
choose this option.  

 
Districts must begin using the attached (Attachment B) Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement 
Form immediately. For those repayment agreements signed on or after August 11, 2009, but 
prior to the release of GIS 09 TA/DC026 on September 1, 2009, which included the newly 
revised Agreement, districts must recalculate the terms of those Agreements and advise the 
impacted recipients of the reduced payment due the agency. The change to the repayment term of 
the agreement is not a district option. 

 
VI. Systems Implications:  None. 

 
Note: Districts remain responsible for establishing a procedure to track the status of 
suspended Utility Arrears Repayment Agreements for the NTA households addressed in 
this ADM. 

 
VII. Additional Information: 
 

Attachment A provides a summary of previously released question and answers relevant to utility 
repayment agreements. 

 
VIII. Effective Date:  
 

Optional suspension of Utility Arrears Repayment Agreement, Effective November 1, 2009. 
 
Change in Terms of Repayment Agreement, Effective August 11, 2009. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Issued By 
Name:  Russell Sykes 
Title:   Deputy Commissioner 
Division/Office: Center for Employment and Economic Supports 


